9/10/2019 North Carolina Sheriffs' Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing

Bid Listing

Continue to bid award | Specification Review

Dealer - - Appatachia _ Dogwaond Cardinal  Longleaf F-‘ing
#1. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - WHELEN Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Whelen Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,926.50 $1,926.50 §1,926.50 $1,926.50

#2. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - WHELEN Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Whelen Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1,926.50 §1,926.50 §1,926.50 $1,926.50

#3. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Sound-Off Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Campbell-Brown Inc $1,797.67 $1,797.67 $1,797.67 $1,797.67
Global Public Safety LLC $1,989.07 $1,989.07 $1,989.07 $1,989.07

#4. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed
Sound-Off Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package

Campbell-Brown Inc $1,797.67 $1,797.67 51,797.67 $1,797.67
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §2,430.01 $2,430.01 §2,430.01 $2,430.01
Global Public Safety LLC $2,389.07 $2,389.07 $2,389.07 $2,389.07

#5. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - BROOKING Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Brooking Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,671.60 $1,671.60 $1,671.60 $1,671.60

#6. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - BROOKING Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Brooking Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package ,
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1,671.60 §1,671.60 $1,671.60 $1,671.60

#7. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - FEDERAL Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Federal Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $1,830.00 -~ No bid -- $1,830.00 -« No bid -
Batteries of NC -- No bid -- $1,815.00 -~ No bid -- $1,815.00

#8. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - FEDERAL Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Federal Full Size Deluxe Light Bar Package
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $2,345.00 -- No bid -- $2,345.00 -- No bid --

#9. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - D&R Electronics Full Size Light Bar Warning Package -
Uninstalled

D&R Efectronics Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,672.60 §1,672.60 $1,672.60 $1,672.60

#10. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - D&R Electronics Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

D&R Electronics Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Instalied
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,672.60 $1,672.60 $1,672.60 $1,672.60

#11. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package 1 - Code 3 Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Code 3 Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled
Global Public Safety LLC $2,007.31 $2,007.31 $2,007.31 $2,007.31

#12. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package 1 - Code 3 Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed
Code 3 Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed
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Global Public Safety LLC $2,407.31 §2,407.31 §2,407.31 §2,407.31

#13. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package 2 - Code 3 Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Code 3 Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled
Global Public Safety LLC §2,130.96 $2,130.96 $2,130.96 $2,130.96

#14. Deluxe Marked Patrol Package 2 - Code 3 Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Code 3 Deluxe Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Global Public Safety LLC $2,530.96 $2,530.96 $2,530.96 $2,530.96
#17. Standard Marked Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package -
Uninstalled

Sound-Off Full Size Standard Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Campbell-Brown inc $1,797.67 $1,797.67 §1,797.67 §1,797.67
Global Public Safety LLC $1,508.13 $1,508.13 $1,508.13 $1,508.13

#18. Standard Marked Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed
Sound-Off Full Size Standard Light Bar Package

Campbell-Brown Inc $1,797.67 $1,797.67 $1,797.67 §1,797.67
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,860.90 $1,860.90 $1,860.90 $1,860.90
Global Public Safety LLC $1,808.13 51,808.13 $1,808.13 $1,808.13

#19. Standard Marked Patrol Package - BROOKING Fuli-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Brooking Full Size Standard Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,569.50 $1,569.50 $1,569.50 $1,569.50

#20. Standard Marked Patrol Package - BROOKING Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Brooking Full Size Standard Light Bar Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,569.50 $1,569.50 $1,569.50 $1,569.50

#21. Standard Marked Patrol Package - FEDERAL Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Federal Full Size Standard Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $1,550.00 $1,550.00 $1,550.00 $1,550.00

#22. Standard Marked Patrol Package - FEDERAL Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Federal Full Size Standard Light Bar Package
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $2,065.00 $2,065.00 $2,065.00 $2,065.00

#23. Standard Marked Patrol Package - D&R Electronics Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package -
Uninstalled

D&R Electronics Standard Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,635.80 $1,635.80 $1,635.80 $1,635.80
#24. Standard Marked Patrol Package - D&R Electronics Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package -
Installed

D&R Electronics Standard Patrol Package Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,635.80 $1,635.80 $1,635.80 $1,635.80

#25. Standard Marked Patrol Package - Code 3 Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Code 3 Standard Marked Patrol Package - Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled
Global Public Safety LLC $1,726.07 §1,726.07 §1,726.07 $1,726.07

#26. Standard Marked Patrol Package - Code 3 Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Code 3 Standard Patrol Package Full Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed
Global Public Safety LLC $2,166.07 $2,166.07 $2,166.07 $2,166.07

#27. Basic Marked Patrol Package - WHELEN Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled
Whelen Full Size Basic Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
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Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,127.70 $1,127.70 $1,127.70 $1,127.70

#28. Basic Marked Patrol Package - WHELEN Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Whelen Futl Size Basic Light Bar Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1,127.70 $1,127.70 $1,127.70 $1,127.70

#29. Basic Marked Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Sound-Off Full Size Basic Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Campbell-Brown Inc $1,363.99 §1,363.99 $1,363.99 $1,363.99
Global Public Safety LLC $1,508.13 $1,508.13 $1,508.13 $1,508.13

#30. Basic Marked Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed
Sound-Off Full Size Basic Light Bar Package

Campbell-Brawn Inc $1,363.99 $1,363.99 $1,363.99 $1,363.99
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $2,117.60 $2,117.60 $2,117.60 $2,117.60
Global Public Safety LLC $1,808.13 $1,808.13 $1,808.13 $1,808.13

#31. Basic Marked Patrol Package - BROOKING Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Brooking Full Size Basic Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,346.50 $1,346.50 $1,346.50 $1,346.50

#32. Basic Marked Patrol Package - BROOKING Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Installed

Brooking Full Size Basic Light Bar Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1,346.50 $1,346.50 §1,346.50 $1,346.50

#35. Basic Marked Patrol Package - Code 3 Full-Size Light Bar Warning Package - Uninstalled

Code 3 Full Size Basic Light Bar Package - Uninstalled
Global Public Safety LLC $1,726.07 §1,726.07 $1,726.07 §1,726.07

#37. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - WHELEN - Uninstalled

Whelen Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,600.10 $1,600.10 $1,600.10 $1,600.10

#38. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - WHELEN - Installed

Whelen Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1,600.10 $1,600.10 $1,600.10 $1,600.10

#39. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF - Uninstailed
Sound-Off Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package - Uninstalled

Campbell-Brown Inc $1,517.65 $1,517.65 $1,517.65 $1,517.65
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,902.00 $1,902.00 $1,902.00 $1,902.00
Global Public Safety LLC $1,554.41 §1,554.41 §1,554.41 §1,554.41

#40. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - SOUND-OFF - Installed
Sound-Off Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package

Campbell-Brewn Inc $1,517.65 $1,517.65 51,517.65 $1,517.65
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1,902.00 $1,902.00 $1,902.00 §1,902.00
Global Public Safety LLC $1,854.41 $1,854.41 $1,854.41 $1,854.41

#41. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - BROOKING - Uninstalled

Brooking Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,278.10 $1,278.10 $1,278.10 $1,278.10

#42. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package ~ BROOKING - Installed

Brooking Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. 51,278.10 $1,278.10 $1,278.10 $1,278.10

#43. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - FEDERAL - Uninstalled
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Federal Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package - Uninstalled
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $2,015.00 $2,015.00 $2,015.00 $2,015.00

#44. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - FEDERAL - Installed

Federal Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $2,960.00 52,960.00 $2,960.00 $2,960.00

#46. Unmarked Sedan/SUV Patrol Package - D&R Electronics - Installed

D&R Electronics Sedan/SUV Unmarked Patrol Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $2,814.30 $2,814.30 $2,814.30 $2,814.30

#49. Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - WHELEN - Uninstalled

Whelen Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $957.30 $957.30 $957.30 $957.30

#50. Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - WHELEN - Installed

Whelen Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $957.30 $957.30 £957.30 $957.30

#51, Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - SOUND-OFF - Uninstalled

Sound-Off Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - Uninstalled
Campbeli-Brown Inc $936.94 $936.94 $936.94 5936.54
Global Public Safety LLC $1,034.54 $1,034.54 $1,034.54 $1,034.54

#52. Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - SOUND-OFF - Installed
Sound-Off Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package

Campbell-Brown Inc $936,94 $936.94 4936.94 $936.94
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1,251.80 41,251.80 $1,251.80 $1,251.80
Global Public Safety LLC $1,214.54 $1,214.54 §t,214.54 $1,214.54

#53. Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - FEDERAL - Uninstalled

Federal Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package -~ Uninstalled
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $1,390.00 $1,390.00 $1,390.00 $1,390.00

#54. Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - FEDERAL - Installed

Federal Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING $2,247.00 $2,247.00 52,247.00 $2,247.00

#55. Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - BROOKING - Uninstalled

Brooking Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $786.90 $786.90 $786.90 $786.90

#56. Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package - BROOKING - installed

Brooking Detective/Administrative Sedan/SUV Package
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $786.90 $786.90 $786.90 §786.90

#59. SETINA Vehicle Equipment - Uninstailed

Setina Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1.00 51.00 $1.00 $1.00

#60. SETINA Vehicle Equipment - Installed

Setina Vehicle Equipment
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1.00 51.00 $1.00 $1.00

#61. PRO GARD Vehicle Equipment - Uninstatled

Pro Gard Vehicle Equipment - Uninstailed
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

#62. PRO GARD Equipment - Installed
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Pro Gard Vehicle Equipment - Installed.
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

#63. HAVIS Vehicle Equipment ~ Uninstalled

Havis Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

#64. HAVIS Vehicle Equipment - Installed

Havis Vehicle Equipment
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

#65. GAMBER JOHNSON Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

Gamber Johnson Vehicle Equipment Package - Uninstalled
Campbell-Brown Inc $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

#66. GAMBER JOHNSON Vehicle Equipment - Installed

Gamber Johnson Vehicle Equipment
Campbell-Brown Inc $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $1.00 51.00 $1.00 $1.00

#67. D&R Electronics Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

D&R Electronics Console Packages
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. §1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

#68. D&R Electronics Vehicle Equipment - Installed

D&R Electronics Vehicle Equipment - Instalied
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. 51.00 $1.00 £1.00 $1.00

#69. Jotto - Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

Jotto Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled
Campbell-Brown Inc $1.00 $1.00 $1.00 $1.00

#70. Jotto - Vehicle Equipment - Installed

Jotto Vehicle Equipment - Installed
Campbelt-Brown Inc $1.00 51.00 51.00 $1.00

#71. Sedan Specific Console Package - Jotto - Installed

Jotto Vehicle Specific Console Package - Sedan - Installed
Campbell-Brown Inc $1.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#72. Sedan Specific Console Package - Jotto - Uninstalled

Jotto Vehicle Specific Console Package - Sedan - Uninstalled
Campbetl-Brown Inc 51.00 -~ No bid -- -~ No bid -- -- No bid --

#73. Utility Specific Console Package - Jotto - Installed

Jotto Vehicle Specific Console Package - Utility - Installed
Campbell-Brown Inc $1.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -~ Na bid --

#74. Utility Specific Console Package - Jotto - Uninstalled

Jotto Vehicle Specific Console Package - Utility - Uninstalled
Campbell-Brown Inc $1.00 -~ No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#75. Sedan Specific Computer Package - Jotto - Uninstalled

Jotto Sedan Specific Computer Package - Uninstalled
Campbell-Brown Inc $1.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#76. Sedan Specific Computer Package - Jotto - Installed

Jotto Sedan Specific Computer Package - Installed
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$1.00 -- No bid -- -- No

#77. Utility Specific Computer Package - Jotto - Installed
Jotto Vehicle Specific Computer Package - Utility - Installed

Campbell-Brown Inc

$1.00 -~ No bid - -- No

#78. Utility Specific Computer Package - Jotto - Uninstalled
Jotto Vehicle Specific Computer Package - Utility - Uninstalled

Campbell-Brown Inc

#81. Go Rhino Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

Go Rhino Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

Pana Safety Supply, Inc.

#82. Go Rhino Vehicle Equipment - Installed
Go Rhino Vehicle Equipment - Installed

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

$1.00 -- No bid -- -~ No
$1.00 51.00
$1.00 $1.00

#85. Streamlight Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled
Streamlight Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
Global Public Safety LLC

#86. Streamlight Vehicle Equipment - Installed
Streamlight Vehicle Equipment - Installed

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
Global Public Safety LLC

#87. American Aluminum K9 Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

American Aluminum K9 Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

Global Public Safety LLC

#88. American Aluminum K9 Vehicle Equipment - Installed

American Aluminum K9 Vehicle Equipment - Installed

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
Global Public Safety LLC

#89. Truck Vault Equipment - Uninstalled
Truck Vault Vehicle Equipment - Uninstalled

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

#90. Truck Vault Equipment - Installed
Truck Vault Vehicle Equipment - Installed.

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

#95. American Aluminum - Catalog Discount
Big Sky Law Enforcement Racks Catalog Discount

Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
Global Public Safety LLC

#98. BROOKING INDUSTRIES - Catalog Discount

Brooking Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

#100. Code 3 - Catalog Discount
Panorama Antennas Catalog Discount

Global Public Safety LLC

bid --

bid --

bid --

$1.00

$1.00

$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
51.00 $1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
$1.00 $1.00 $1.00
$40.00 $40.00 $40.00
$42.00 $42.00 $42.00
$35.,00 $35.00 $35,00
$32.00 $32.00 $32.00

#102. D&R Electronics - Catalog Discount
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D&R Electronics Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $32.00 $32.00 $32.00 $32.00

#103. Ecco - Catalog Discount

Kussmaul Catalog Discount
Campbell-Brown Inc $37.00 §37.00 $37.00 $37.00

#104. FEDERAL SIGNAL - Catalog Discount

Federal Catalog Discount
ILDERTON CONVERSION EMERGENCY LIGHTING 544.00 $44.00 $44.00 $44.00

#105. Feniex - Catalog Discount

Feniex Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $40.00 $40.00 $40.00 $40.00

#106. GAMBER JOHNSON - Catalog Discount

Gamber Johnson Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. ‘ $42.00 $42.00 $42.00 $42.00
Global Public Safety LLC $31.00 $31.00 $31.00 $31.00

#107. Go Light Equipment - Catalog Discount

Go Light Catalog Discount
Campbell-Brown Inc $30.70 $30.70 $30.70 $30.70

Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $30.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00
#108. Go Rhino - Catalog Discount

HiNT Mounts Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $35.50 $35.50 $35.50 $35.50

#109. HAVIS - Catalog Discount

Hella Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $41.00 $41.00 $41.00 $41.00
Global Pubtic Safety LLC $25.00 §25.00 $25.00 $25.00

#110. Hella - Catalog Discount

Hella Catalog Discount
Campbell-Brown Inc $36.00 $36.00 $36.00 $36.00

#112. Jotto - Catalog Discount

Jotto Catalog Discount
Campbell-Brown Inc $35.00 -- No bid -- -- No bid -- -- No bid --

#114. Lund Equipment - Catalog Discount

Lund Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $18.00 $18.00 $18.00 518.00

#115. MNStar Technologies - Catalog Discount

MNStar Technologies Catalog Discount ,
Dana Safety Supply, Inc. $6.00 56.00 $6.00 $6.00

#116. Panasonic - Catalog Discount

Panorama Antennas Catalog Discount
Global Public Safety LLC . $13.00 $13.00 $13.00 $13.00

#119. Patrol PC (Advanced Electronic Design, Inc.) - Catalog Discount

Antenna Plus Antennas Catalog Discount
Global Public Safety LLC $20.00 §20.00 $20.00 $20.00

#120. PRO GARD - Catalog Discount
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Pro Gard Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc.
Global Public Safety LLC

North Carolina Shetiffs' Association's Vehicle Bid Award System - Bid Listing

#122, Santa Cruz Gun Racks - Catalog Discount
Santa Cruz Gun Racks Catalog Discount

Campbell-Brown Inc
Global Public Safety LLC

#123, SETINA - Catalog Discount

Setina Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc,
Global Public Safety LLC

#124. SOUND OFF, INC. - Catalog Discount

Sound-Off Catalog Discount
Campbell-Brown Inc
Global Public Safety LLC

#125. STI-CO - Catalog Discount

ST1-CO Catalog Discount
Global Public Safety LLC

#126. Streamlight Equipment - Catalog Discount
Streamlight Equipment Catalog Discount

Dana Safety Supply, inc.
Global Public Safety LLC

#129. Troy Equipment - Catalog Discount

Tiger Tough Catalog Discount
Campbell-Brown Inc
Global Public Safety LLC

#130. Truck Vault - Catalog Discount

Truck Vault Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

$35.00 $35.00 $35.00
$25.00 $25.00 $25.00
$38.00 $38.00 $38.00
$25.00 $25.00 $25.00
$30.00 $30.00 $30.00
$15.00 $15.00 $15.00
$52.00 $52.00 $52.00
$44.00 $44.00 $44.00

$2.00 $2.00 $2.00
$46.00 $46.00 $46.00
$32.00 $32.00 $32.00
$38.50 $38.50 $38.50
$28.00 $28.00 $28.00
$21.00 $21.00 $21.00

#131. UNITY MFG. - Catalog Discount (Spotlights)
Antenna Plus Antennas Catalog Discount

Campbell-Brown inc
Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

#132. Westin - Catalog Discount

Westin Catalog Discount
Global Pubtlic Safety LLC

#133. WHELEN ENGINEERING - Catalog Discount

Whelen Catalog Discount
Dana Safety Supply, Inc.

$51.00 $51.00 $51.00
$51.00 $51.00 $51.00
$32.00 $32.00 $32.00
$46.00 $46.00 $46.00
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