
Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3490, Falcon, 1 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler - Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $16,532.94 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3490&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3490&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3491, Falcon, 10 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $116,723.12 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3491&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3491&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3492, Falcon, 2 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $26,129.88 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3492&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3492&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3493, Falcon, 2 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $32,224.34 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3493&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3493&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3494, Falcon, 2 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Single burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $20,196.09 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3494&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3494&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3495, Falcon, 2 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Single burner)- Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $26,290.55 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3495&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3495&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3496, Falcon, 3 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $39,381.46 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3496&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3496&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3497, Falcon, 3 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Single burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $33,447.67 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3497&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3497&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3498, Falcon, 4 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $40,242.00 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3498&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3498&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3499, Falcon, 4 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $39,343.32 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3499&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3499&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3500, Falcon, 4 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $39,343.32 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3500&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3500&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3501, Falcon, 4 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Single burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $34,308.21 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3501&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3501&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3502, Falcon, 4 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Single burner)- Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $33,409.53 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3502&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3502&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3503, Falcon, 4 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Single burner)- Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $33,409.53 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3503&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3503&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3504, Falcon, 5 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $48,637.11 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3504&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3504&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3505, Falcon, 5 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Single burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $42,703.32 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3505&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3505&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3506, Falcon, 6 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $60,641.59 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3506&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3506&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3507, Falcon, 6 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Trailer 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $72,804.49 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3507&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3507&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3508, Falcon, 8 Ton Asphalt Hot Box and Recycler (Dual burner)- Slip In 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $80,732.18 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3508&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3508&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3509, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-425-80 DHE / CNG / mounted on new Freightliner M2 - 4.5 cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $158,413.22 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3509&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3509&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3510, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-425-80 DHED Diesel Burner 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $158,413.22 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3510&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3510&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3511, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-425-80 HTE mounted on new Freightliner M2 - 4.5 cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $162,813.69 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3511&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3511&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3512, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-425-80-DHE Mounted on new Freightliner M2 Cab Chassis 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $158,413.22 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3512&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3512&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3514, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-500-100 HTE mounted on new Freightliner M2 - 5.0 cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $159,391.10 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3514&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3514&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3515, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-500-100-DHE mounted on new Freightliner M2 Cab Chassis 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $159,391.10 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3515&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3515&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3517, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-500-80 AEPHT mounted on new Freightliner M2 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $169,169.92 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3517&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3517&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3518, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-500-80 DHED / diesel fired / mounted on new Freightliner M2 - 5.0 cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $159,391.10 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3518&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3518&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3519, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-600-100 DHED Diesel mounted on new Freightliner with tandem axle M2 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $168,077.73 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3519&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3519&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3520, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-600-100 HTE mounted on new Freightliner M2 - 6.0 cubic yards tandem axle M2 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $172,478.20 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3520&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3520&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3521, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TCM-600-100-DHE mounted on new Freightliner M2 Cab Chassis tandem axle M2 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $168,077.73 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3521&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3521&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3523, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TM-300-40-DHE trailer model - 3.0 cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $102,195.07 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3523&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3523&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3524, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TM-425-80-DHE trailer model - 4.5 Cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $112,413.94 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3524&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3524&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3526, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TM-500-100-DHE trailer model - 5.0 cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $120,774.83 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3526&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3526&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3527, H.D Industries, Pro-Patch , TM-600-100-DHE trailer model - 6.0 cubic yards 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Public Works Equipment $121,752.71 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3527&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69747&sv=0&i=3527&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3530, PB Loader Corp, B-5 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Infrastructure Solutions Group, Inc. $163,660.00 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69955&sv=0&i=3530&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69955&sv=0&i=3530&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3532, Schwarze, Roadpatcher 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Carolina Industrial Equipment LLC $249,770.00 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69871&sv=0&i=3532&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69871&sv=0&i=3532&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3533, Schwarze, Spray Patcher Load King 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Carolina Industrial Equipment LLC $97,436.00 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69871&sv=0&i=3533&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69871&sv=0&i=3533&ft=o


Bid Award 

Contract: 22-06-0426, Heavy Equipment 

Group: Pothole Patching Equipment 

Item: 3534, Schwarze, Spray Patcher Street Max 

Description: Manufacturer`s standard base unit specifications and current model year for the model/model number listed. The required minimum 6%
discount off MSRP is to be included in the listed base price field. The percentage field displayed is the discount that will be taken off of MSRP for all
applicable options. 

Model Upgrade/Downgrade: 

Zone Vendor Price Percent: Build File Options File

Statewide Carolina Industrial Equipment LLC $100,780.00 6.00% Build Options 

https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69871&sv=0&i=3534&ft=b
https://www.myvendorlink.com/common/ViewFile.aspx?DocType=vrf&s=104472&v=69871&sv=0&i=3534&ft=o

